
Update August 2022

1. The congregation of Christ Church in Brittany was told by Robin Adams that
he and his wife were returning to the USA to retire.  This was untrue, instead
he has gone to Athens and joined the team of ACNA - the American Church
in North America.  This purports to be an Anglican Church and so it is but it is
not to be confused with the Anglican Church based on Lambeth London.

2. ACNA calls itself an Anglican Church with the deliberate intention of
confusuing.  It is as misleading as the days when East German was called the
German Democratic Republic which as we know was far from democratic and
ACNA is not part of the Anglican Communion.

3. The Clergy of ACNA are homophobic and has done much bad work in the
USA and France.

Update March 2022

4. We had expected that with Robin Adams out of the way that the congregation
of Christ Church in Brittany would reach out to us and welcome us to their
services.  To date no such approach has been made.

Update as at 28 February 2021 

1. We have spent the last year in virtual lockdown so we have been unable to
progress our visible campaign very much.  However we have been contacted
by several people who simply feel they don’t want to go to a homophobic
church which is what Christ Church in Brittany had become. 

2. The good news is that Robin Adams’ contract at the Church has come to an
end and that he has returned to the USA.  W e are told that his wife was never
happy in France.  We have learnt that both Robin Adams and his wife Donna
are both American citizens even though Robin Adams was born in N Ireland. 

3. We hope that their lives will be happier and their religion more welcomed in
the USA in a way that he failed to welcome us here in Brittany.  The bad news
is for Americans that Robin Adams will be able to continue to spread his
homophobic views amongst a population, many of which are crying out for
acceptance. LINKS: La Gazette du Centre Morbihan

4. https://actu.fr/bretagne/ploermel_56165/pasteur-robin-thomas-adams-l
eglise-anglicane-fete-vingt-ans-dexistence_29750538.html The article is
translated into English in our downloads/translation.pdf


